
OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORP
Form 10-K
March 18, 2019
UNITED STATES
SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION
Washington, D.C. 20549
_______________

FORM 10-K
_______________
(Mark One)
☒ANNUAL REPORT PURSUANT TO SECTION 13 OR 15(d) OF THE SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934
For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2018
or

☐TRANSITION REPORT PURSUANT TO SECTION 13 OR 15(d) OF THE SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF1934
For the transition period from __________ to __________

Commission file number 000-12896
_______________

OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORPORATION
(Exact name of registrant as specified in its charter)
_______________

Virginia 54-1265373
(State or other jurisdiction of incorporation or organization) (IRS Employer Identification No.)

1 West Mellen Street, Hampton, Virginia 23663
(Address of principal executive offices) (Zip Code)

(757) 728-1200
(Registrant's telephone number, including area code)
_______________

Securities registered pursuant to Section 12(b) of the Act:

Common Stock, $5 par value The NASDAQ Stock Market LLC
(Title of each class) (Name of each exchange on which registered)

Securities registered pursuant to Section 12(g) of the Act:
None
_______________

Indicate by check mark if the registrant is a well-known seasoned issuer, as defined in Rule 405 of the Act. Yes ☐ No ☒

Indicate by check mark if the registrant is not required to file reports pursuant to Section 13 or Section 15(d) of the
Act. Yes ☐ No ☒

Edgar Filing: OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORP - Form 10-K

1



Indicate by check mark whether the registrant (1) has filed all reports required to be filed by Section 13 or 15(d) of the
Securities Exchange Act of 1934 during the preceding 12 months (or for such shorter period that the registrant was
required to file such reports), and (2) has been subject to such filing requirements for the past 90 days.Yes ☒No ☐

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant has submitted electronically every Interactive Data File required to be
submitted pursuant to Rule 405 of Regulation S-T (§ 232.405 of this chapter) during the preceding 12 months (or for
such shorter period that the registrant was required to submit such files).Yes ☒No ☐

Indicate by check mark if disclosure of delinquent filers pursuant to Item 405 of Regulation S-K (§ 229.405 of this
chapter) is not contained herein, and will not be contained, to the best of registrant's knowledge, in definitive proxy or
information statements incorporated by reference in Part III of this Form 10-K or any amendment to this Form 10-K.☒

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is a large accelerated filer, an accelerated filer, a non-accelerated filer, a
smaller reporting company, or an emerging growth company. See the definitions of “large accelerated filer,” “accelerated
filer,” “smaller reporting company,” and "emerging growth company" in Rule 12b-2 of the Exchange Act.

Large accelerated filer ☐Accelerated filer ☒

Non-accelerated filer ☐Smaller reporting company ☒

Emerging growth company ☐

If an emerging growth company, indicate by check mark if the registrant has elected not to use the extended transition
period for complying with any new or revised financial accounting standards provided pursuant to Section 13(a) of the
Exchange Act.   ☐

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is a shell company (as defined in Rule 12b-2 of the Act). Yes ☐ No ☒

The aggregate market value of voting and non-voting stock held by non-affiliates of the registrant as of June 29, 2018
was $109,738,216 based on the closing sales price on the NASDAQ Capital Market of $28.86.

There were 5,185,151 shares of common stock outstanding as of March 12, 2019.

DOCUMENTS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE

Portions of the Proxy Statement for the Company’s Annual Meeting of Stockholders to be held on May 28, 2019, are
incorporated by reference in Part III of this report.

Edgar Filing: OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORP - Form 10-K

2



OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORPORATION

FORM 10-K

INDEX

PART I Page

Item 1. Business 1
Item 1A. Risk Factors 7
Item 1B. Unresolved Staff Comments 14
Item 2. Properties 14
Item 3. Legal Proceedings 14
Item 4. Mine Safety Disclosures 14

PART II

Item 5. Market for Registrant's Common Equity, Related Stockholder Matters and Issuer Purchases of Equity
Securities 15

Item 6. Selected Financial Data 16
Item 7. Management’s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations 17
Item 7A. Quantitative and Qualitative Disclosures About Market Risk 38
Item 8. Financial Statements and Supplementary Data 38
Item 9. Changes in and Disagreements With Accountants on Accounting and Financial Disclosure 91
Item 9A. Controls and Procedures 91
Item 9B. Other Information 92

PART III

Item 10. Directors, Executive Officers and Corporate Governance 92
Item 11. Executive Compensation 93
Item 12. Security Ownership of Certain Beneficial Owners and Management and Related Stockholder Matters 93
Item 13. Certain Relationships and Related Transactions, and Director Independence 93
Item 14. Principal Accountant Fees and Services 93

PART IV

Item 15. Exhibits, Financial Statement Schedules 93
Index to Consolidated Financial Statements 93
Index to Exhibits 94

Item 16. Form 10-K Summary 95
Signatures 96

Edgar Filing: OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORP - Form 10-K

3



- i -

Part I
Item 1. Business

GENERAL

Old Point Financial Corporation (the Company) was incorporated under the laws of Virginia on February 16, 1984,
for the purpose of acquiring all the outstanding common stock of The Old Point National Bank of Phoebus (the Bank),
in connection with the reorganization of the Bank into a one-bank holding company structure. At the annual meeting
of the stockholders on March 27, 1984, the proposed reorganization was approved by the requisite stockholder vote.
At the effective date of the reorganization on October 1, 1984, the Bank merged into a newly formed national bank as
a wholly-owned subsidiary of the Company, with each outstanding share of common stock of the Bank being
converted into five shares of common stock of the Company.

The Company completed a spin-off of its trust department as of April 1, 1999. The organization is chartered as Old
Point Trust & Financial Services, N.A. (Trust). Trust is a nationally chartered trust company. The purpose of the
spin-off was to have a corporate structure more ready to compete in the field of wealth management. Trust is a
wholly-owned subsidiary of the Company.

The Bank is a national banking association that was founded in 1922. As of the end of 2018, the Bank had 19 branch
offices serving the Hampton Roads localities of Hampton, Newport News, Norfolk, Virginia Beach, Chesapeake,
Williamsburg/James City County, York County and Isle of Wight County. The Bank offers a complete line of
consumer, mortgage and business banking services, including loan, deposit, and cash management services to
individual and commercial customers.

The Company’s primary activity is as a holding company for the common stock of the Bank and Trust. The principal
business of the Company is conducted through its subsidiaries, which continue to conduct business in substantially the
same manner as before the reorganization and spin-off.

As of December 31, 2018, the Company had assets of $1,038.2 million, gross loans of $774.0 million, deposits of
$843.1 million, and stockholders' equity of $102.0 million. At year-end, the Company and its subsidiaries had a total
of 301 employees, 16 of whom were part-time.

STRATEGIC ACQUISITION

On April 1, 2018, the Company acquired Citizens National Bank (Citizens). Under the terms of the merger agreement,
Citizens stockholders received 0.1041 shares of Company common stock and $2.19 in cash for each share of Citizens
stock. Systems integration was completed in May 2018.

MARKET AREA AND COMPETITION
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The Company’s market area is located in Hampton Roads, situated in the southeastern corner of Virginia and boasting
the world’s largest natural deepwater harbor. The Hampton Roads Metropolitan Statistical Area (MSA) is the 37th
most populous MSA in the United States according to the U.S. Census Bureau’s 2010 census and the 3rd largest
deposit market in Virginia, after Richmond and the Washington Metropolitan area, according to the Federal Deposit
Insurance Corporation (FDIC). Hampton Roads includes the cities of Chesapeake, Hampton, Newport News, Norfolk,
Poquoson, Portsmouth, Suffolk, Virginia Beach and Williamsburg, and the counties of Isle of Wight, Gloucester,
James City, Mathews, York and Surry. The market area is serviced by 56 banks, savings institutions and credit unions
and, in addition, branches of virtually every major brokerage house serve the Company’s market area.

The banking business in Virginia, and in the Company’s primary service areas in the Hampton Roads MSA, is highly
competitive and dominated by a relatively small number of large banks with many offices operating over a wide
geographic area. Among the advantages such large banks have over the Company is their ability to finance
wide-ranging advertising campaigns, and by virtue of their greater total capitalization, to have substantially higher
lending limits than the Company. Factors such as interest rates offered, the number and location of branches and the
types of products offered, as well as the reputation of the institution affect competition for deposits and loans. The
Company competes by emphasizing customer service and technology, establishing long-term customer relationships
and building customer loyalty, and providing products and services to address the specific needs of the Company’s
customers. The Company targets individual and small-to-medium size business customers. The Company also faces
competitive pressure from large credit unions in the area. The three largest credit unions headquartered in the
Hampton Roads MSA are Langley Federal Credit Union, Chartway Federal Credit Union, and Newport News
Shipbuilding Employees’ Credit Union.

The Company continues to build a strong presence in the business banking market, as well as expanding into other
fee-based lines of business. In 2017, the Company purchased full ownership of Old Point Mortgage, LLC and
launched Old Point Insurance, LLC. Through these comprehensive business services and new lines of business, the
Company is able to service a highly lucrative market that offers increased opportunities for new fee-based revenue
streams and to cross sell additional products.

AVAILABLE INFORMATION

The Company maintains a website on the Internet at www.oldpoint.com. The Company makes available free of
charge, on or through its website, its proxy statements, annual reports on Form 10-K, quarterly reports on Form 10-Q,
current reports on Form 8-K and any amendments to those reports as soon as reasonably practicable after such
material is electronically filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC). This reference to the Company’s
Internet address shall not, under any circumstances, be deemed to incorporate the information available at such
Internet address into this Form 10-K or other SEC filings. The information available at the Company’s Internet address
is not part of this Form 10-K or any other report filed by the Company with the SEC. The Company's SEC filings can
also be obtained on the SEC’s website on the Internet at www.sec.gov.
1
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REGULATION AND SUPERVISION

General. Bank holding companies, banks and their affiliates are extensively regulated under both federal and state law.
The following summary briefly describes significant provisions of currently applicable federal and state laws and
certain regulations and the potential impact of such provisions. This summary is not complete and is qualified in its
entirety by reference to the particular statutory or regulatory provisions or proposals. Because regulation of financial
institutions changes regularly and is the subject of constant legislative and regulatory debate, no assurance can be
given as to forecast how federal and state regulation and supervision of financial institutions may change in the future
and affect the Company’s and the Bank’s operations.

As a public company, the Company is subject to the periodic reporting requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of
1934, as amended (the Exchange Act), which include, but are not limited to, the filing of annual, quarterly and other
reports with the SEC. The Company is also required to comply with other laws and regulations of the SEC applicable
to public companies.

As a national bank, the Bank is subject to regulation, supervision and regular examination by the Office of the
Comptroller of the Currency (the Comptroller). The prior approval of the Comptroller or other appropriate bank
regulatory authority is required for a national bank to merge with another bank or purchase the assets or assume the
deposits of another bank. In reviewing applications seeking approval of merger and acquisition transactions, the bank
regulatory authorities will consider, among other things, the competitive effect and public benefits of the transactions,
the capital position of the constituent organizations and the combined organization, the risks to the stability of the U.S.
banking or financial system, the applicant's performance record under the Community Reinvestment Act (the CRA)
and fair housing initiatives, the data security and cybersecurity infrastructure of the constituent organizations and the
combined organization, and the effectiveness of the subject organizations in combating money laundering activities.
Each depositor's account with the Bank is insured by the FDIC to the maximum amount permitted by law. The Bank is
also subject to certain regulations promulgated by the FRB and applicable provisions of Virginia law, insofar as they
do not conflict with or are not preempted by federal banking law.

As a non-depository national banking association, Trust is subject to regulation, supervision and regular examination
by the Comptroller. Trust's exercise of fiduciary powers must comply with regulations promulgated by the
Comptroller at 12 C.F.R. Part 9 and with Virginia law.

The regulations of the FRB, the Comptroller and the FDIC govern most aspects of the Company's business, including
deposit reserve requirements, investments, loans, certain check clearing activities, issuance of securities, payment of
dividends, branching, and numerous other matters.  Further, the federal bank regulatory agencies have adopted
guidelines and released interpretive materials that establish operational and managerial standards to promote the safe
and sound operation of banks and bank holding companies.  These standards relate to the institution's key operating
functions, including but not limited to internal controls, internal audit systems, loan documentation, credit
underwriting, interest rate exposure, asset growth, asset quality, earnings, compensation of management, information
systems, data security and cybersecurity, and risk management.  As a consequence of the extensive regulation of
commercial banking activities in the United States, the Company's business is particularly susceptible to changes in
state and federal legislation and regulations, which may have the effect of increasing the cost of doing business,
limiting permissible activities or increasing competition.

As a bank holding company, the Company is subject to the BHCA and regulation and supervision by the FRB. A bank
holding company is required to obtain the approval of the FRB before making certain acquisitions or engaging in
certain activities. Bank holding companies and their subsidiaries are also subject to restrictions on transactions with
insiders and affiliates.
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A bank holding company is required to obtain the approval of the FRB before it may acquire all or substantially all of
the assets of any bank, and before it may acquire ownership or control of the voting shares of any bank if, after giving
effect to the acquisition, the bank holding company would own or control more than 5 percent of the voting shares of
such bank. The approval of the FRB is also required for the merger or consolidation of bank holding companies.

Pursuant to the BHCA, the FRB has the power to order any bank holding company or its subsidiaries to terminate any
activity or to terminate its ownership or control of any subsidiary when the FRB has reasonable grounds to believe
that continuation of such activity or ownership constitutes a serious risk to the financial soundness, safety or stability
of any bank subsidiary of the bank holding company.

The Company is required to file periodic reports with the FRB and provide any additional information the FRB may
require. The FRB also has the authority to examine the Company and its subsidiaries, as well as any arrangements
between the Company and its subsidiaries, with the cost of any such examinations to be borne by the Company. 
Banking subsidiaries of bank holding companies are also subject to certain restrictions imposed by federal law in
dealings with their holding companies and other affiliates.

Regulatory Reform. The financial crisis of 2008, including the downturn of global economic, financial and money
markets and the threat of collapse of numerous financial institutions, and other events led to the adoption of numerous
laws and regulations that apply to, and focus on, financial institutions. The most significant of these laws is the
Dodd-Frank Act, which was enacted on July 21, 2010 and, in part, was intended to implement significant structural
reforms to the financial services industry.
2
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In May 2018, the Economic Growth, Regulatory Relief and Consumer Protection Act (the EGRRCPA) was enacted to
reduce the regulatory burden on certain banking organizations, including community banks, by modifying or
eliminating certain federal regulatory requirements. While the EGRRCPA maintains most of the regulatory structure
established by the Dodd-Frank Act, it amends certain aspects of the regulatory framework for small depository
institutions with assets of less than $10 billion as well as for larger banks with assets above $50 billion. In addition,
the EGRRCPA included regulatory relief for community banks regarding regulatory examination cycles, call reports,
application of the Volcker Rule (proprietary trading prohibitions), mortgage disclosures, qualified mortgages, and risk
weights for certain high-risk commercial real estate loans. However, federal banking regulators retain broad discretion
to impose additional regulatory requirements on banking organizations based on safety and soundness and U.S.
financial system stability considerations.

The Company continues to experience ongoing regulatory reform. These regulatory changes could have a significant
effect on how the Company conducts its business. The specific implications of the Dodd-Frank Act, the EGRRCPA,
and other potential regulatory reforms cannot yet be fully predicted and will depend to a large extent on the specific
regulations that are to be adopted in the future. Certain aspects of the Dodd-Frank Act and the EGRRCPA are
discussed in more detail below.

The Dodd-Frank Act. The Dodd-Frank Act implements far-reaching changes across the financial regulatory
landscape, including changes that will affect all bank holding companies and banks, including the Company and the
Bank. Among other provisions, the Dodd-Frank Act:

·
changed the assessment base for federal deposit insurance from the amount of insured deposits to consolidated assets
less tangible capital. The Dodd-Frank Act also made permanent the $250,000 limit for federal deposit insurance and
increased the cash limit of Securities Investor Protection Corporation protection from $100,000 to $250,000;

·repealed the federal prohibitions on the payment of interest on demand deposits, thereby permitting depositoryinstitutions to pay interest on business transaction and other accounts;

·created and centralized significant aspects of consumer financial protection by creating a new agency, the ConsumerFinancial Protection Bureau (CFPB), which is discussed in more detail below;

·imposed limits for debit card interchange fees for issuers that have assets greater than $10 billion, which also couldaffect the amount of interchange fees collected by financial institutions with less than $10 billion in assets;

·restricted the preemption of state law by federal law and disallowed subsidiaries and affiliates of national banks fromavailing themselves of such preemption;

·
imposed comprehensive regulation of the over-the-counter derivatives market subject to significant rulemaking
processes, to include certain provisions that would effectively prohibit insured depository institutions from
conducting certain derivatives businesses in the institution itself;

·required loan originators to retain 5 percent of any loan sold or securitized, unless it is a "qualified residentialmortgage", subject to certain restrictions;

·prohibited banks and their affiliates from engaging in proprietary trading and investing in and sponsoring certainunregistered investment companies (the Volcker Rule); and

·implemented corporate governance revisions that apply to all public companies, not just financial institutions.
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Some of the rules that have been adopted or proposed to comply with Dodd-Frank Act mandates are discussed in more
detail below.

Capital Requirements and Prompt Corrective Action. The FRB, the Comptroller and the FDIC have adopted
risk-based capital adequacy guidelines for bank holding companies and banks pursuant to the Federal Deposit
Insurance Corporation Improvement Act of 1991 (FDICIA) and the Basel III Capital Accords. See "Management's
Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations – Capital Resources" in Item 7 of this report
on Form 10-K.

The federal banking agencies have broad powers to take prompt corrective action to resolve problems of insured
depository institutions.  Under the FDICIA, there are five capital categories applicable to bank holding companies and
insured institutions, each with specific regulatory consequences. The extent of the agencies' powers depends on
whether the institution in question is "well capitalized," "adequately capitalized," "undercapitalized," "significantly
undercapitalized" or "critically undercapitalized."  These terms are defined under uniform regulations issued by each
of the federal banking agencies.  If the appropriate federal banking agency determines that an insured institution is in
an unsafe or unsound condition, it may reclassify the institution to a lower capital category (other than critically
undercapitalized) and require the submission of a plan to correct the unsafe or unsound condition.
3
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Failure to meet statutorily mandated capital guidelines or more restrictive ratios separately established for a financial
institution could subject the Company and its subsidiaries to a variety of enforcement remedies, including issuance of
a capital directive, the termination of deposit insurance by the FDIC, a prohibition on accepting or renewing brokered
deposits, limitations on the rates of interest that the institution may pay on its deposits, and other restrictions on its
business.  In addition, an institution may not make a capital distribution, such as a dividend or other distribution that is
in substance a distribution of capital to the owners of the institution if following such a distribution the institution
would be undercapitalized. Thus, if the making of such dividend would cause the Bank to become undercapitalized, it
could not pay a dividend to the Company.

Basel III Capital Framework. The federal bank regulatory agencies have adopted rules to implement the Basel III
capital framework as outlined by the Basel Committee on Banking Supervision and standards for calculating
risk-weighted assets and risk-based capital measurements (collectively, the Basel III Final Rules).  For purposes of
these capital rules, (i) common equity Tier 1 capital (CET1) consists principally of common stock (including surplus)
and retained earnings; (ii) Tier 1 capital consists principally of CET1 plus non-cumulative preferred stock and related
surplus, and certain grandfathered cumulative preferred stock and trust preferred securities; and (iii) Tier 2 capital
consists principally of Tier 1 capital plus qualifying subordinated debt and preferred stock, and limited amounts of an
institution's allowance for loan losses.  Each regulatory capital classification is subject to certain adjustments and
limitations, as implemented by the Basel III Final Rules.  The Basel III Final Rules also establish risk weightings that
are applied to many classes of assets held by community banks, including, importantly, applying higher risk
weightings to certain commercial real estate loans.

The Basel III Final Rules were effective on January 1, 2015. The Basel III Final Rules' capital conservation buffer (as
described below) was phased in beginning January 1, 2016 and became fully phased in as of January 1, 2019.  As
fully phased in, the Basel III Final Rules require banks to maintain (i) a minimum ratio of CET1 to risk-weighted
assets of at least 4.5%, plus a 2.5% "capital conservation buffer" (which is added to the 4.5% CET1 ratio, effectively
resulting in a minimum ratio of CET1 to risk-weighted assets of at least 7%), (ii) a minimum ratio of Tier 1 capital to
risk-weighted assets of at least 6.0%, plus the capital conservation buffer (which is added to the 6.0% Tier 1 capital
ratio, effectively resulting in a minimum Tier 1 capital ratio of 8.5%), (iii) a minimum ratio of total (that is, Tier 1 plus
Tier 2) capital to risk-weighted assets of at least 8.0%, plus the capital conservation buffer (which is added to the 8.0%
total capital ratio, effectively resulting in a minimum total capital ratio of 10.5%) and (iv) a minimum leverage ratio of
4%, calculated as the ratio of Tier 1 capital to balance sheet exposures plus certain off-balance sheet exposures
(computed as the average for each quarter of the month-end ratios for the quarter).

The Basel III Final Rules provide deductions from and adjustments to regulatory capital measures, and primarily to
CET1, including deductions and adjustments that were not applied to reduce CET1 under historical regulatory capital
rules.  For example, mortgage servicing rights, deferred tax assets dependent upon future taxable income and
significant investments in non-consolidated financial entities must be deducted from CET1 to the extent that any one
such category exceeds 10% of CET1 or all such categories in the aggregate exceed 15% of CET1.

The Basel III Final Rules also implement a "countercyclical capital buffer," generally designed to absorb losses during
periods of economic stress and to be imposed when national regulators determine that excess aggregate credit growth
becomes associated with a buildup of systemic risk. This buffer is a CET1 add-on to the capital conservation buffer in
the range of 0% to 2.5% when fully implemented (potentially resulting in total buffers of between 2.5% and 5%).

Community Bank Leverage Ratio. As a result of the EGRRCPA, the federal banking agencies were required to
develop a Community Bank Leverage Ratio (the ratio of a bank’s tangible equity capital to average total consolidated
assets) for banking organizations with assets of less than $10 billion, such as the Bank. On November 21, 2018, the
federal banking agencies invited public comment on their proposal to establish the Community Bank Leverage Ratio
framework. Under the proposal, a community banking organization would be eligible to elect the Community Bank
Leverage Ratio framework if it has less than $10 billion in total consolidated assets, limited amounts of certain assets
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and off-balance sheet exposures, and a Community Bank Leverage Ratio greater than 9 percent. A qualifying
community banking organization that has chosen the proposed framework would be automatically considered in
compliance with the Basel III capital requirements and would be exempt from the complex Basel III risk-based capital
calculations. Such a community banking organization would be considered to have met the capital ratio requirements
to be “well capitalized” for the federal banking agencies’ Prompt Corrective Action rules provided it has a Community
Bank Leverage Ratio greater than 9 percent. Because the proposal has not been finalized and a final rule has not been
issued, it is difficult at this time to predict when or how this new capital ratio will ultimately be applied to community
banking organizations or to predict the specific effects of the final rule.

Small Bank Holding Company. The EGRRCPA also expanded the category of bank holding companies that may rely
on the Federal Reserve Board’s Small Bank Holding Company Policy Statement by raising the maximum amount of
assets a qualifying bank holding company may have from $1 billion to $3 billion. In addition to meeting the asset
threshold, a bank holding company must not engage in significant nonbanking activities, not conduct significant
off-balance sheet activities, and not have a material amount of debt or equity securities outstanding and registered
with the SEC (subject to certain exceptions). The Federal Reserve Board may, in its discretion, exclude any bank
holding company from the application of the Small Bank Holding Company Policy Statement if such action is
warranted for supervisory purposes.

In August 2018, the Federal Reserve Board issued an interim final rule to apply the Small Bank Holding Company
Policy Statement to bank holding companies with consolidated total assets of less than $3 billion. The policy
statement, which, among other things, exempts certain bank holding companies from minimum consolidated
regulatory capital ratios that apply to other bank holding companies. As a result of the interim final rule, which was
effective August 30, 2018, the Company expects that it will be treated as a small bank holding company and will no
longer be subject to regulatory capital requirements. The comment period on the interim final rule closed on October
29, 2018. The Bank remains subject to the regulatory capital requirements described above.
4
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Insurance of Accounts, Assessments and Regulation by the FDIC.  The Bank’s deposits are insured by the DIF of the
FDIC up to the standard maximum insurance amount for each deposit insurance ownership category. The basic limit
on FDIC deposit insurance coverage is $250,000 per depositor. Under the FDIA, the FDIC may terminate deposit
insurance upon a finding that the institution has engaged in unsafe and unsound practices, is in an unsafe or unsound
condition to continue operations as an insured institution, or has violated any applicable law, regulation, rule, order or
condition imposed by the FDIC, subject to administrative and potential judicial hearing and review processes.

Deposit Insurance Assessments.  The DIF is funded by assessments on banks and other depository institutions
calculated based on average consolidated total assets minus average tangible equity (defined as Tier 1 capital). As
required by the Dodd-Frank Act, the FDIC has adopted a large-bank pricing assessment scheme, set a target
“designated reserve ratio” (described in more detail below) of 2 percent for the DIF and, in lieu of dividends, provides
for a lower assessment rate schedule when the reserve ratio reaches 2 percent and 2.5 percent. An institution's
assessment rate is based on a statistical analysis of financial ratios that estimates the likelihood of failure over a
three-year period, which considers the institution’s weighted average CAMELS component rating, and is subject to
further adjustments including those related to levels of unsecured debt and brokered deposits (not applicable to banks
with less than $10 billion in assets).  At December 31, 2018, total base assessment rates for institutions that have been
insured for at least five years range from 1.5 to 30 basis points applying to banks with less than $10 billion in assets.

Incentive Compensation. The FRB, the Comptroller and the FDIC have issued regulatory guidance intended to ensure
that the incentive compensation policies of banking organizations do not undermine the safety and soundness of such
organizations by encouraging excessive risk-taking. The FRB will review, as part of the regular, risk-focused
examination process, the incentive compensation arrangements of banking organizations, such as the Company, that
are not "large, complex banking organizations." The findings will be included in reports of examination, and
deficiencies will be incorporated into the organization's supervisory ratings. Enforcement actions may be taken against
a banking organization if its incentive compensation arrangements, or related risk-management control or governance
processes, pose a risk to the organization's safety and soundness and the organization is not taking prompt and
effective measures to correct the deficiencies.

In addition, in 2016, the SEC and the federal banking agencies proposed rules that prohibit covered financial
institutions (including bank holding companies and banks) from establishing or maintaining incentive-based
compensation arrangements that encourage inappropriate risk taking by providing covered persons (consisting of
senior executive officers and significant risk takers, as defined in the rules) with excessive compensation, fees or
benefits that could lead to material financial loss to the financial institution.  The proposed rules outline factors to be
considered when analyzing whether compensation is excessive and whether an incentive-based compensation
arrangement encourages inappropriate risks that could lead to material loss to the covered financial institution, and
establishes minimum requirements that incentive-based compensation arrangements must meet to be considered to not
encourage inappropriate risks and to appropriately balance risk and reward.  The proposed rules also impose
additional corporate governance requirements on the boards of directors of covered financial institutions and impose
additional record-keeping requirements.  The comment period for these proposed rules has closed and a final rule has
not yet been published.

Federal Home Loan Bank of Atlanta. The Bank is a member of the Federal Home Loan Bank (FHLB) of Atlanta,
which is one of 12 regional FHLBs that provide funding to their members for making housing loans as well as for
affordable housing and community development loans. Each FHLB serves as a reserve, or central bank, for the
members within its assigned region. Each FHLB makes loans to members in accordance with policies and procedures
established by the Board of Directors of the FHLB. As a member, the Bank must purchase and maintain stock in the
FHLB. Additional information related to the Bank’s FHLB stock can be found in Note 16: Fair Value Measurements of
the Notes to Consolidated Financial Statements included in Item 8, “Financial Statements and Supplementary Data,” of
this report on Form 10-K.

Edgar Filing: OLD POINT FINANCIAL CORP - Form 10-K

12



Community Reinvestment Act. The Company is subject to the requirements of the CRA, which imposes on financial
institutions an affirmative and ongoing obligation to meet the credit needs of their local communities, including low
and moderate-income neighborhoods, consistent with the safe and sound operation of those institutions. A financial
institution's efforts in meeting community credit needs are currently assessed based on specified factors.  These factors
also are considered in evaluating mergers, acquisitions and applications to open a branch or facility. At its last
evaluation in 2016, the Bank received an “Outstanding” CRA rating.

Confidentiality and Required Disclosures of Consumer Information. The Company is subject to various laws and
regulations that address the privacy of nonpublic personal financial information of consumers. The
Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act and certain regulations issued thereunder protect against the transfer and use by financial
institutions of consumer nonpublic personal information. A financial institution must provide to its customers, at the
beginning of the customer relationship and annually thereafter, the institution's policies and procedures regarding the
handling of customers' nonpublic personal financial information. These privacy provisions generally prohibit a
financial institution from providing a customer's personal financial information to unaffiliated third parties unless the
institution discloses to the customer that the information may be so provided and the customer is given the opportunity
to opt out of such disclosure.

5
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In August 2018, the CFPB published its final rule to update Regulation P pursuant to the amended
Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act. Under this rule, certain qualifying financial institutions are not required to provide annual
privacy notices to customers. To qualify, a financial institution must not share nonpublic personal information about
customers except as described in certain statutory exceptions which do not trigger a customer’s statutory opt-out right.
In addition, the financial institution must not have changed its disclosure policies and practices from those disclosed in
its most recent privacy notice. The rule sets forth timing requirements for delivery of annual privacy notices in the
event that a financial institution that qualified for the annual notice exemption later changes its policies or practices in
such a way that it no longer qualifies for the exemption.

The Company is also subject to various laws and regulations that attempt to combat money laundering and terrorist
financing. The Bank Secrecy Act requires all financial institutions to, among other things, create a system of controls
designed to prevent money laundering and the financing of terrorism, and imposes recordkeeping and reporting
requirements. The USA Patriot Act facilitates information sharing among governmental entities and financial
institutions for the purpose of combating terrorism and money laundering, and requires financial institutions to
establish anti-money laundering programs. The Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC), which is a division of the
U.S. Department of the Treasury, is responsible for helping to ensure that United States entities do not engage in
transactions with "enemies" of the United States, as defined by various Executive Orders and Acts of Congress. If the
Bank finds a name of an "enemy" of the United States on any transaction, account or wire transfer that is on an OFAC
list, it must freeze such account or place transferred funds into a blocked account, file a suspicious activity report with
the Treasury and notify the FBI.

Although these laws and programs impose compliance costs and create privacy obligations and, in some cases,
reporting obligations, and compliance with all of the laws, programs, and privacy and reporting obligations may
require significant resources of the Company and the Bank, these laws and programs do not materially affect the
Bank’s products, services or other business activities.

Cybersecurity. The federal banking agencies have adopted guidelines for establishing information security standards
and cybersecurity programs for implementing safeguards under the supervision of a financial institution’s board of
directors. These guidelines, along with related regulatory materials, increasingly focus on risk management and
processes related to information technology and the use of third parties in the provision of financial products and
services. The federal banking agencies expect financial institutions to establish lines of defense and ensure that their
risk management processes also address the risk posed by compromised customer credentials, and also expect
financial institutions to maintain sufficient business continuity planning processes to ensure rapid recovery,
resumption and maintenance of the institution’s operations after a cyber-attack. If the Company, the Bank or Trust fails
to meet the expectations set forth in this regulatory guidance, the Company, the Bank or Trust could be subject to
various regulatory actions and any remediation efforts may require significant resources.

In October 2016, the federal banking agencies issued proposed rules on enhanced cybersecurity risk-management and
resilience standards that would apply to very large financial institutions and to services provided by third parties to
these institutions. The comment period for these proposed rules has closed and a final rule has not been published.
Although the proposed rules would apply only to bank holding companies and banks with $50 billion or more in total
consolidated assets, these rules could influence the federal banking agencies’ expectations and supervisory
requirements for information security standards and cybersecurity programs of smaller financial institutions, such as
the Company, the Bank and Trust.

Consumer Laws and Regulations. The Company is also subject to certain consumer laws and regulations that are
designed to protect consumers in transactions with banks. While the list set forth herein is not exhaustive, these laws
and regulations include the Truth in Lending Act, the Truth in Savings Act, the Electronic Funds Transfer Act, the
Equal Credit Opportunity Act, the Fair Credit Reporting Act and the Fair Housing Act, among others. These laws and
regulations mandate certain disclosure requirements and regulate the manner in which financial institutions transact
business with customers. The Company must comply with the applicable provisions of these consumer protection
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laws and regulations as part of its ongoing customer relations.

The CFPB is the federal regulatory agency responsible for implementing, examining and enforcing compliance with
federal consumer financial laws for institutions with more than $10 billion of assets and, to a lesser extent, smaller
institutions. The CFPB supervises and regulates providers of consumer financial products and services and has
rulemaking authority in connection with numerous federal consumer financial protection laws (for example, but not
limited to, the Truth in Lending Act and the Real Estate Settlement Procedures Act).  As a smaller institution (i.e.,
with assets of $10 billion or less), most consumer protection aspects of the Dodd-Frank Act will continue to be
applied to the Company by the FRB and to the Bank and Trust by the Comptroller. However, the CFPB may include
its own examiners in regulatory examinations by a smaller institution's prudential regulators and may require smaller
institutions to comply with certain CFPB reporting requirements. In addition, regulatory positions taken by the CFPB
and administrative and legal precedents established by CFPB enforcement activities, including in connection with
supervision of larger bank holding companies and banks, could influence how the FRB and Comptroller apply
consumer protection laws and regulations to financial institutions that are not directly supervised by the CFPB. The
precise effect of the CFPB's consumer protection activities on the Company cannot be forecast. As of January 1, 2019,
the Company and the Bank are not subject to the direct supervision of the CFPB.

6
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Mortgage Banking Regulation.  In connection with making mortgage loans, the Bank is subject to rules and
regulations that, among other things, establish standards for loan origination, prohibit discrimination, provide for
inspections and appraisals of property, require credit reports on prospective borrowers, in some cases, restrict certain
loan features and fix maximum interest rates and fees, require the disclosure of certain basic information to
mortgagors concerning credit and settlement costs, limit payment for settlement services to the reasonable value of the
services rendered and require the maintenance and disclosure of information regarding the disposition of mortgage
applications based on race, gender, geographical distribution and income level. The Bank's mortgage origination
activities are subject to the Equal Credit Opportunity Act, Truth in Lending Act, Home Mortgage Disclosure Act, Real
Estate Settlement Procedures Act, and Home Ownership Equity Protection Act, and the regulations promulgated
under these acts, among other additional state and federal laws, regulations and rules.

The Bank's mortgage origination activities are also subject to Regulation Z, which implements the Truth in Lending
Act.  Certain provisions of Regulation Z require mortgage lenders to make a reasonable and good faith determination,
based on verified and documented information, that a consumer applying for a mortgage loan has a reasonable ability
to repay the loan according to its terms. Alternatively, a  mortgage  lender  can  originate  "qualified mortgages",
which are generally defined as mortgage loans without negative amortization, interest-only payments, balloon
payments, terms exceeding 30 years, and points and fees paid by a consumer equal to or less than 3% of the total loan
amount. Under the EGRRCPA, most residential mortgages loans originated and held in portfolio by a bank with less
than $10 billion in assets will be designated as “qualified mortgages.” Higher-priced qualified mortgages (e.g., subprime
loans) receive a rebuttable presumption of compliance with ability-to-repay rules, and other qualified mortgages (e.g.,
prime loans) are deemed to comply with the ability-to-repay rules. The Bank does not originate first mortgage loans at
this time, and the first mortgages it purchases comply with Regulation Z's "qualified mortgage" rules. The Bank does
originate second mortgages, or equity loans, and these loans do not conform to the qualified mortgage criteria but
comply with applicable ability-to-repay rules.

Volcker Rule. The Dodd-Frank Act prohibits bank holding companies and their subsidiary banks from engaging in
proprietary trading except in limited circumstances, and places limits on ownership of equity investments in private
equity and hedge funds (the Volcker Rule). The EGRRCPA exempted all banks with less than $10 billion in assets
(including their holding companies and affiliates) from the Volcker Rule, provided that the institution has total trading
assets and liabilities of five percent or less of total assets, subject to certain limited exceptions. In December 2018, the
federal banking agencies invited public comment on a proposal to exclude community banks from the application of
the Volcker Rule. The Company believes that its financial condition and its operations are not and will not be
significantly affected by the Volcker Rule, amendments thereto, or its implementing regulations.

Call Reports and Examination Cycle. All institutions, regardless of size, submit a quarterly call report that includes
data used by federal banking agencies to monitor the condition, performance, and risk profile of individual institutions
and the industry as a whole. The EGRRCPA contained provisions expanding the number of regulated institutions
eligible to use streamline call report forms. In November 2018, the federal banking agencies issued a proposal to
permit insured depository institutions with total assets of less than $5 billion that do not engage in certain complex or
international activities to file the most streamlined version of the quarterly call report, and to reduce data reportable on
certain streamlined call report submissions.

In December 2018, consistent with the provisions of the EGRRCPA, the federal banking agencies jointly adopted
final rules that permit banks with up to $3 billion in total assets, that received a composite CAMELS rating of “1” or “2,”
and that meet certain other criteria (including not having undergone any change in control during the previous
12-month period, and not being subject to a formal enforcement proceeding or order), to qualify for an 18-month
on-site examination cycle.

Future Regulation. From time to time, various legislative and regulatory initiatives are introduced in Congress and
state legislatures, as well as by regulatory agencies. Such initiatives may include proposals to expand or contract the
powers of bank holding companies and depository institutions or proposals to substantially change the financial
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institution regulatory system. Such legislation could change banking statutes and the operating environment of the
Company in substantial and unpredictable ways. If enacted, such legislation could increase or decrease the cost of
doing business, limit or expand permissible activities or affect the competitive balance among banks, savings
associations, credit unions, and other financial institutions. The Company cannot predict whether any such legislation
will be enacted, and, if enacted, the effect that it, or any implementing regulations, would have on the financial
condition or results of operations of the Company. A change in statutes, regulations or regulatory policies applicable
to the Company or the Bank (or Trust) could have a material effect on our business.

Item 1A. Risk Factors

U.S. and international economic conditions and credit markets pose challenges for the Company and could adversely
affect the results of operations, liquidity and financial condition. In recent years, economic growth and business
activity in the Company's local markets as well as in the broader national and international economies, has been
modest. In addition, uncertainty regarding oil prices, ongoing federal budget negotiations, and the level of U.S. debt
may present challenges to businesses and have a destabilizing effect on financial markets. Unfavorable or uncertain
economic conditions generally could cause a decline in the value of the Company's securities portfolio, and could
increase the regulatory scrutiny of financial institutions. Another deterioration of local economic conditions could
again lead to declines in real estate values and home sales and increases in the financial stress on borrowers and
unemployment rates, all of which could lead to increases in loan delinquencies, problem assets and foreclosures and
reductions in loan collateral value. Such a deterioration of local economic conditions could cause the level of loan
losses to exceed the level the Company has provided in its allowance for loan losses which, in turn, would reduce the
Company's earnings.

7
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Global credit market conditions could return to being disrupted and volatile. Although the Company remains well
capitalized and has not suffered any liquidity issues, the cost and availability of funds may be adversely affected by
illiquid credit markets. Any future turbulence in the U.S. and international markets and economy may adversely affect
the Company's liquidity, financial condition and profitability.

The Company is subject to interest rate risk and variations in interest rates may negatively affect its financial
performance. The Company's profitability depends in substantial part on its net interest margin, which is the
difference between the rates received on loans and investments and the rates paid for deposits and other sources of
funds. The net interest margin depends on many factors that are partly or completely outside of the Company's
control, including competition; federal economic, monetary and fiscal policies; and economic conditions. Because of
the differences in the maturities and repricing characteristics of interest-earning assets and interest-bearing liabilities,
changes in interest rates do not produce equivalent changes in interest income earned on interest-earning assets and
interest paid on interest-bearing liabilities. Accordingly, fluctuations in interest rates could adversely affect the
Company's net interest margin and, in turn, its profitability.

The Company generally seeks to maintain a neutral position in terms of the volume of assets and liabilities that mature
or re-price during any period so that it may reasonably maintain its net interest margin; however, interest rate
fluctuations, loan prepayments, loan production, deposit flows, and competitive pressures are constantly changing and
influence the ability to maintain a neutral position. Generally, the Company's earnings will be more sensitive to
fluctuations in interest rates depending upon the variance in volume of assets and liabilities that mature and re-price in
any period. The extent and duration of the sensitivity will depend on the cumulative variance over time, the velocity
and direction of changes in interest rates, shape and slope of the yield curve, and whether the Company is more asset
sensitive or liability sensitive. Accordingly, the Company may not be successful in maintaining a neutral position and,
as a result, the Company's net interest margin may be affected. For additional details, See "Management's Discussion
and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations – Interest Sensitivity" in Item 7 of this report on Form
10-K.

In addition, any substantial and prolonged increase in market interest rates could reduce the Company's customers'
desire to borrow money or adversely affect their ability to repay their outstanding loans by increasing their credit
costs. Interest rate changes could also affect the fair value of the Company's financial assets and liabilities.
Accordingly, changes in levels of market interest rates could materially and adversely affect the Company's net
interest margin, asset quality, loan origination volume, business, financial condition, results of operations and cash
flows.

System failures, interruptions, breaches of security, or the failure of a third-party provider to perform its obligations
could adversely impact the Company's business operations and financial condition. Communications and information
systems are essential to the conduct of the Company's businesses, as such systems are used to manage customer
relationships, general ledger, deposits and loans. While the Company has established policies and procedures to
prevent or limit the impact of systems failures, interruptions and security breaches, the Company's information,
security, and other systems may stop operating properly or become disabled or damaged as a result of a number of
factors, including events beyond the Company's control, such as sudden increases in customer transaction volume,
electrical or telecommunications outages, natural disasters, and cyber-attacks. Information security risks have
increased in recent years and hackers, activists and other external parties have become more technically sophisticated
and well-resourced. These parties use a variety of methods to attempt to breach security systems and access the data of
financial services institutions and their customers.  The Company may not have the resources or technical
sophistication to anticipate or prevent rapidly evolving types of cyber-attacks. In addition, any compromise of the
security systems could deter customers from using the Bank's website and online banking service, both of which
involve the transmission of confidential information. The security and authentication precautions imposed by the
Company and the Bank may not protect the systems from compromises or breaches of security, which would
adversely affect the Company's results of operations and financial condition.
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In addition, the Company outsources certain data processing to certain third-party providers. Accordingly, the
Company's operations are exposed to risk that these third-party providers will not perform in accordance with the
contracted arrangements under service agreements. If the third-party providers encounter difficulties, or if the
Company has difficulty in communicating with them, the Company's ability to adequately process and account for
customer transactions could be affected, and the Company's business operations could be adversely impacted. Further,
a breach of a third-party provider's technology may cause loss to the Company's customers. Replacing these
third-party providers could also create significant delay and expense. Threats to information security also exist in the
processing of customer information through various other vendors and their personnel.

The occurrence of any systems failure, interruption or breach of security, or the failure of a third-party provider to
perform its obligations, could expose the Company to risks of data loss or data misuse, could result in violations of
applicable privacy and other laws, could damage the Company's reputation and result in a loss of customers and
business, could subject it to additional regulatory scrutiny or could expose it to civil litigation, possible financial
liability and costly response measures. Any of these occurrences could have a material adverse effect on the
Company's financial condition and results of operations.

8
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The Company's accounting estimates and risk management processes rely on analytical and forecasting
models. Processes that management uses to measure the fair value of financial instruments, as well as the processes
used to estimate the effects of changing interest rates and other market measures on the Company's earnings
performance and liquidity, depend upon the use of analytical and forecasting models. These models reflect
assumptions that may not be accurate, particularly in times of market stress or other unforeseen circumstances. Even if
these assumptions are accurate, the models may prove to be inadequate or inaccurate because of other flaws in their
design or their implementation.

If the models that management uses for interest rate risk and asset-liability management are inadequate, the Company
may incur increased or unexpected losses upon changes in market interest rates or other market measures and may be
unable to maintain sufficient liquidity. If the models that management uses to measure the fair value of financial
instruments are inadequate, the fair value of such financial instruments may fluctuate unexpectedly or may not
accurately reflect what the Company could realize upon sale or settlement of such financial instruments. Any such
failure in management's analytical or forecasting models could have a material adverse effect on the Company's
business, financial condition and results of operations.

Weaknesses in the commercial real estate markets could negatively affect the Company's financial performance due to
the Company's concentration in commercial real estate loans. At December 31, 2018, the Company had $347.9
million, or 44.94%, of total loans concentrated in commercial real estate, which includes, for purposes of this
concentration, all construction loans, loans secured by multifamily residential properties, loans secured by farmland
and loans secured by nonfarm, nonresidential properties. Commercial real estate loans expose the Company to a
greater risk of loss than residential real estate and consumer loans. Commercial real estate loans typically involve
larger loan balances to single borrowers or groups of related borrowers compared to residential real estate loans.
Consequently, an adverse development with respect to one commercial real estate loan or credit relationship exposes
the Company to a significantly greater risk of loss compared to an adverse development with respect to one residential
real estate loan. Commercial real estate loans carry risks associated with the successful operation of a business if the
properties are owner occupied. If the properties are non-owner occupied, the repayment of these loans may be
dependent upon the profitability and cash flow from rent receipts. Repayment of commercial real estate loans may, to
a greater extent than residential real estate loans, be subject to adverse conditions in the real estate market or economy.
Weak economic or market conditions may impair a borrower's business operations, slow the execution of new leases
and lead to turnover in existing leases. The combination of these factors could result in deterioration in value of some
of the Company's loans. The deterioration of one or more of the Company's significant commercial real estate loans
could cause a significant increase in nonaccrual loans. An increase in nonaccrual loans could result in a loss of interest
income from those loans, an increase in the provision for loan losses, and an increase in loan charge-offs, all of which
could have a material adverse effect on the Company's financial performance.

The Company's profitability depends significantly on local economic conditions and changes in the federal
government's military or defense spending may negatively affect the local economy. The Company's success depends
primarily on the general economic conditions of the markets in which the Company operates. Unlike larger financial
institutions that are more geographically diversified, the Company provides banking and financial services to
customers primarily in the Hampton Roads MSA. The local economic conditions in this area have a significant impact
on the demand for loans, the ability of the borrowers to repay these loans and the value of the collateral securing these
loans. A significant decline in general economic conditions, caused by inflation, recession, acts of terrorism, an
outbreak of hostilities or other international or domestic calamities, unemployment or other factors beyond the
Company's control could impact these local economic conditions.

In addition, Hampton Roads is home to one of the largest military installations in the world and one of the largest
concentrations of Department of Defense personnel in the United States. Some of the Company's customers may be
particularly sensitive to the level of federal government spending on the military or on defense-related products.
Federal spending is affected by numerous factors, including macroeconomic conditions, presidential administration
priorities, and the ability of the federal government to enact relevant appropriations bills and other legislation. Any of
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these factors could result in future cuts to military or defense spending or increased uncertainty about federal
spending, which could have a severe negative impact on individuals and businesses in the Company's primary service
area. Any related increase in unemployment rates or reduction in business development activities in the Company's
primary service area could lead to reductions in loan demand, increases in loan delinquencies, problem assets and
foreclosures and reductions in loan collateral value, which could have a material adverse effect on the Company's
operating results and financial condition.

The Company is subject to losses resulting from fraudulent and negligent acts on the part of loan applicants,
correspondents or other third parties. The Company relies heavily upon information supplied by third parties,
including the information contained in credit applications, employment and income documentation, property
appraisals, title information, and equipment pricing and valuation, in deciding which loans to originate, as well as in
establishing the terms of those loans. If any of the information upon which the Company relies during the loan
approval process is misrepresented, either fraudulently or inadvertently, and the misrepresentation is not detected prior
to asset funding, the value of the asset may be significantly lower than expected, the Company may fund a loan that it
would not have otherwise funded or the Company may fund a loan on terms that it would not have otherwise
extended. Whether a misrepresentation is made by the applicant or by another third party, the Company generally
bears the risk of loss associated with the misrepresentation. In addition, a loan subject to a material misrepresentation
is typically unsellable or subject to repurchase if it is sold prior to detection of the misrepresentation. The sources of
the misrepresentation are often difficult to locate, and it may be difficult to recover any monetary loss the Company
may suffer.

9
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Declines in loans outstanding could have a material adverse impact on the Company's operating results and financial
condition. Growing and diversifying the loan portfolio is part of the Company's strategic initiative.  If quality loan
demand does not continue to increase and the Company's loan portfolio begins to decline, the Company expects that
excess liquidity will be invested in marketable securities. Because loans typically yield higher returns than the
Company's securities portfolio, a shift towards investments in the Company's asset mix would likely result in an
overall reduction in net interest income and the net interest margin. The principal source of earnings for the Company
is net interest income, and as discussed above, the Company's net interest margin is a major determinant of the
Company's profitability. The effects of a reduction in net interest income and the net interest margin may be
exacerbated by the intense competition for quality loans in the Company's primary service area and by rate reductions
on loans currently held in the portfolio. As a result, a reduction in loans could have a material adverse effect on the
Company's operating results and financial condition.

The Company's substantial dependence on dividends from its subsidiaries may prevent it from paying dividends to its
stockholders and adversely affect its business, results of operations or financial condition. The Company is a separate
legal entity from its subsidiaries and does not have significant operations or revenues of its own. The Company
substantially depends on dividends from its subsidiaries to pay dividends to stockholders and to pay its operating
expenses. The availability of dividends from the subsidiaries is limited by various statutes and regulations. It is
possible, depending upon the financial condition of the Company and other factors, that the Comptroller could assert
that payment of dividends by the subsidiaries is an unsafe or unsound practice. In the event the subsidiaries are unable
to pay dividends to the Company, the Company may not be able to pay dividends on the Company's common stock,
service debt or pay operating expenses. Consequently, the inability to receive dividends from the subsidiaries could
adversely affect the Company's financial condition, results of operations, cash flows and limit stockholders' return, if
any, to capital appreciation.

The small-to-medium size businesses the Company targets may have fewer financial resources to weather a downturn
in the economy, which could materially harm operating results. The Company targets individual and small-to-medium
size business customers. Small-to-medium size businesses frequently have smaller market shares than their
competitors, may be more vulnerable to economic downturns, often need substantial additional capital to expand and
compete and may experience significant volatility in operating results. Any one or more of these factors may impair a
borrower's ability to repay a loan. In addition, the success of a small-to-medium size business often depends on the
management talents and efforts of one person or a small group of persons, and the death, disability or resignation of
one or more of these persons could have a material adverse impact on the business and its ability to repay a loan.
Economic downturns and other events that negatively impact businesses in the Company's primary service area could
have a proportionately greater impact on small-to-medium-size businesses and accordingly could cause the Company
to incur substantial credit losses that could negatively affect its results of operations and financial condition.

The ownership of foreclosed property exposes the Company to significant costs, some of which are uncertain. When
the Company has to foreclose upon real property held as collateral, the Company is exposed to the risks inherent in the
ownership of real estate. The amount that the Company may realize after a loan default is dependent upon factors
outside of the Company's control, including environmental cleanup liability, especially with regard to non-residential
real estate, neighborhood values, real estate tax rates, operating or maintenance expenses of the foreclosed properties,
and supply of and demand for properties. Significant costs associated with the ownership of real estate may exceed the
income earned from such real estate, and the Company may have to advance funds to protect its investment or dispose
of the real estate at a loss.  These factors may materially and adversely affect the Company's business, financial
condition, cash flows and result of operations.

The Company and its subsidiaries are subject to extensive regulation which could adversely affect them. The
Company is subject to extensive regulation by federal, state and local governmental authorities and is subject to
various laws and judicial and administrative decisions imposing requirements and restrictions on part or all of
operations, including those referenced above. Regulations adopted by these agencies, which are generally intended to
protect depositors and customers rather than to benefit stockholders, govern a comprehensive range of matters
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including, without limitation, ownership and control of the Company's shares, acquisition of other companies and
businesses, permissible activities that the Company and its subsidiaries may engage in, maintenance of adequate
capital levels and other aspects of operations. These regulations could limit the Company's growth by restricting
certain of its activities. The laws, rules and regulations applicable to the Company are subject to regular modification
and change. Regulatory changes could subject the Company to more demanding regulatory compliance requirements
which could affect the Company in unpredictable and adverse ways. Such changes could subject the Company to
additional costs, limit the types of financial services and products it may offer and/or increase the ability of non-banks
to offer competing financial services and products, among other things. Failure to comply with laws, regulations or
policies could result in sanctions by regulatory agencies, civil money penalties and/or damage to the Company's
reputation, which could have a material adverse effect on the Company's business, financial condition and results of
operations. Legislation and regulatory initiatives containing wide-ranging proposals for altering the structure,
regulation and competitive relationship of financial institutions are introduced regularly. The Company cannot predict
in what form or whether a proposed statute or regulation will be adopted or the extent to which such adoption may
affect its business.

Market risk affects the earnings of Trust. The fee structure of Trust is generally based upon the market value of
accounts under administration. Most of these accounts are invested in equities of publicly traded companies and debt
obligations of both government agencies and publicly traded companies. As such, fluctuations in the equity and debt
markets in general have had a direct impact upon the earnings of Trust.
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Compliance with the CFPB regulations aimed at the mortgage banking industry may require substantial changes to
mortgage lending systems and processes that may adversely affect income from the Company's residential mortgage
activities. The CFPB has finalized a number of significant rules that impact nearly every aspect of the lifecycle of a
residential real estate loan. Among other things, the rules adopted by the CFPB require mortgage lenders either to
make a reasonable and good faith determination, based on verified and documented information, that a consumer
applying for a mortgage loan has a reasonable ability to repay the loan according to its terms, or to originate "qualified
mortgages." In June 2015, the CFPB issued rules that combined disclosures previously established by the Truth in
Lending Act and the Real Estate Settlement Procedures Act into a single disclosure referred to as the TILA-RESPA
Integrated Disclosure, or TRID. TRID applies to most closed-end mortgage loans and overhauls the manner in which
mortgage loan origination disclosures are made.

Although the Company does not originate or sell first mortgage loans at this time, it may elect to do so in the future,
and TRID does apply to the mortgages it purchases. TRID also applies to second mortgages originated by the
Company (but not to equity lines of credit). During 2015, the Company made significant changes to its residential real
estate business, including investments in technology and employee training. These CFPB rules, in addition to other
previously-issued and to-be-issued CFPB regulations, could materially affect the Company's ability to originate and
sell residential real estate loans or limit the terms on which the Company may offer products, which could adversely
affect the Company's financial condition and results of operations.

The Basel III Final Rules require higher levels of capital and liquidity, which could adversely affect the Company's
net income and return on equity. The capital adequacy and liquidity guidelines applicable to the Company and the
Bank under the Basel III Final Rules began to be phased in beginning in 2015. The Basel III Final Rules, fully phased
in as of January 1, 2019, require the Company and the Bank to maintain substantially more capital as a result of higher
minimum capital levels and more demanding regulatory capital risk-weightings and calculations. The changes to the
standardized calculations of risk-weighted assets are complex and may create additional compliance burdens for the
Company and the Bank. The Basel III Final Rules require the Company and the Bank to substantially change the
manner in which they collect and report information to calculate risk-weighted assets, and may increase dramatically
risk-weighted assets as a result of applying higher risk weightings to many types of loans and securities. As a result,
the Company and the Bank may be forced to limit originations of certain types of commercial and mortgage loans,
thereby reducing the amount of credit available to borrowers and limiting opportunities to earn interest income from
the loan portfolio, which may have a detrimental impact on the Company's net income.

If the Company were to require additional capital as a result of the Basel III Final Rules, it could be required to access
the capital markets on short notice and in relatively weak economic conditions, which could result in raising capital
that significantly dilutes existing stockholders. Additionally, the Company may be forced to limit banking operations
and activities, and growth of loan portfolios and interest income, to focus on retention of earnings to improve capital
levels. Higher capital levels may also lower the Company's return on equity.

The Company is dependent on key personnel and the loss of one or more of those key personnel could harm its
business. The banking business in Virginia, and in the Company's primary service area in the Hampton Roads MSA, is
highly competitive and dominated by a relatively small number of large banks. Competition for qualified employees
and personnel in the banking industry is intense and there are a limited number of qualified persons with knowledge of
and experience in the Virginia community banking industry. The Company's success depends to a significant degree
upon its ability to attract and retain qualified management, loan origination, administrative, marketing and technical
personnel and upon the continued contributions of and customer relationships developed by management and
personnel. In particular, the Company's success is highly dependent upon the capabilities of its senior executive
management. The Company believes that its management team, comprised of individuals who have worked in the
banking industry for many years, is integral to implementing the Company's business plan. The Company has not
entered into employment agreements with any of its executive management employees, and the loss of the services of
one or more of them could harm the Company's business.
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The allowance for loan losses may not be adequate to cover actual losses. A significant source of risk arises from the
possibility that losses could be sustained because borrowers, guarantors, and related parties may fail to perform in
accordance with the terms of their loans and leases. There is no precise method to predict loan losses. Like all
financial institutions, the Company maintains an allowance for loan losses (ALL) to provide for loan defaults and
non-performance. Accounting measurements related to impairment and the allowance for loan losses require
significant estimates that are subject to uncertainty and changes relating to new information and changing
circumstances. The allowance for loan losses may not be adequate to cover actual loan losses. In addition, future
provisions for loan losses could materially and adversely affect, and have in recent years materially and adversely
affected, the Company's operating results.

11
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The allowance for loan losses is determined by analyzing historical loan losses, current trends in delinquencies and
charge-offs, plans for problem loan resolutions, changes in the size and composition of the loan portfolio and industry
information. Also included in management's estimates for loan losses are considerations with respect to the impact of
economic events, the outcome of which are uncertain. The determination of the appropriate level of the allowance for
loan losses inherently involves a high degree of subjectivity and judgment. The amount of future losses is susceptible
to changes in economic and other conditions, including changes in interest rates, that may be beyond the Company's
control and these future losses may exceed current estimates. If management's assumptions prove to be incorrect or if
the Company experiences significant loan losses in future periods, the current level of the allowance for loan losses
may not be adequate to cover actual loan losses and adjustments may be necessary. In addition, federal regulatory
agencies, as an integral part of their examination process, review the Company's loans and allowance for loan losses
and may require an increase in the allowance for loan losses or recognition of additional loan charge-offs, based on
judgments different from those of management. While management believes that the Company's allowance is
adequate to cover current losses, the Company cannot assure investors that it will not need to increase the allowance
or that regulators will not require the allowance to be increased. Either of these occurrences could materially and
adversely affect earnings and profitability.

Additionally, the measure of the Company's ALL is dependent on the adoption and interpretation of accounting
standards. In June 2016, the FASB issued ASU No. 2016-13, “Financial Instruments - Credit Losses (Topic 326):
Measurement of Credit Losses on Financial Instruments,” Under this ASU, the current incurred loss credit impairment
methodology will be replaced with the CECL model, a methodology that reflects expected credit losses and requires
consideration of a broader range of reasonable and supportable information to inform credit loss estimates.
Accordingly, the implementation of the CECL model will change the Company's current method of providing ALL
and may result in material changes in the Company's accounting for credit losses on financial instruments. The CECL
model may create more volatility in the Company's level of ALL. If the Company is required to materially increase its
level of ALL for any reason, such increase could adversely affect its business, financial condition, and results of
operations. The amendment is effective for fiscal years beginning after December 15, 2019. See Note 1 “Summary of
Significant Accounting Policies” in the "Notes to the Consolidated Financial Statements” contained in Item 8 of this
Form 10-K for information regarding the Company’s implementation of CECL.

The Company may be adversely affected by changes in government monetary policy. As a bank holding company, the
Company's business is affected by the monetary policies established by the FRB, which regulates the national money
supply in order to mitigate recessionary and inflationary pressures. In setting its policy, the FRB may utilize
techniques such as the following:

·Engaging in open market transactions in U.S. Government securities;
·Setting the discount rate on member bank borrowings; and
·Determining reserve requirements.

These techniques determine, to a significant extent, the Company's cost of funds for lending and investing. These
techniques, all of which are outside the Company's control, may have an adverse effect on deposit levels, net interest
margin, loan demand or the Company's business and operations.

The Company's future success depends on its ability to compete effectively in the highly competitive financial
services industry. The Company faces substantial competition in all phases of its operations from a variety of different
competitors. Growth and success depends on the Company's ability to compete effectively in this highly competitive
financial services environment. Many competitors offer products and services that are not offered by the Company,
and many have substantially greater resources, name recognition and market presence that benefit them in attracting
business. In addition, larger competitors may be able to price loans and deposits more aggressively and may have
larger lending limits that would allow them to serve the credit needs of larger customers. In addition, financial
technology start-ups are emerging in key areas of banking.  Some of the financial services organizations with which
the Company competes are not subject to the same degree of regulation as is imposed on bank holding companies and
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federally insured national banks, and may have broader geographic services areas and lower cost structures.  As a
result, these non-bank competitors have certain advantages over the Company in accessing funding and in providing
various services. The financial services industry could become even more competitive as a result of legislative,
regulatory and technological changes and continued consolidation. Failure to compete effectively to attract new and
retain current customers in the Company's markets could cause it to lose market share, slow its growth rate and may
have an adverse effect on its financial condition and results of operations.
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The Company may not be able to compete effectively without the appropriate use of current technology. The use of
technology in the financial services market, including the banking industry, evolves frequently. The Company may be
unable to attract and maintain banking relationships with certain customers if it does not offer appropriate
technology-driven products and services. In addition to better serving customers, the effective use of technology may
increase efficiency and reduce costs. The Company may not be able to effectively implement new technology-driven
products or services or be successful in marketing these products and services to its customers. As a result, the
Company's ability to compete effectively may be impaired, which could lead to a material adverse effect on the
Company's financial condition and results of operations.

Negative public opinion could damage the Company's reputation and adversely impact the Company's business,
financial condition and results of operation. Reputation risk, or the risk to the Company's business, financial condition
and results of operation from negative public opinion, is inherent in the financial services industry. Negative public
opinion can result from actual or alleged conduct in any number of activities, including lending or foreclosure
practices, regulatory compliance, corporate governance and sharing or inadequately protecting customer information,
and from actions taken by government regulators and community organizations in response to those activities.
Negative public opinion could adversely affect the Company's ability to keep and attract customers and employees,
could expose it to litigation and regulatory action, and could adversely affect its access to the capital markets. Damage
to the Company's reputation could adversely affect deposits and loans and otherwise negatively affect the Company's
business, financial condition and results of operation.

Deposit insurance premiums could increase in the future, which may adversely affect future financial
performance. The FDIC insures deposits at FDIC insured financial institutions, including the Bank. The FDIC charges
insured financial institutions premiums to maintain the DIF at a certain level. Economic conditions from 2008 to 2011
increased the rate of bank failures and expectations for further bank failures, requiring the FDIC to make payments for
insured deposits from the DIF. Although the DIF has since been replenished, a similar economic downturn in the
future could require measures similar to those implemented during the last financial crisis, such as special assessments
or required prepayments of insurance premiums. If the FDIC takes action to replenish the DIF, or if the Bank's asset
size increases, the Bank's FDIC insurance premiums could increase, which could have an adverse effect on the
Company's results of operations.

The Company may need to raise additional capital in the future and such capital may not be available when needed or
at all. The Company may need to raise additional capital in the future to provide it with sufficient capital resources
and liquidity to meet its commitments and business needs, particularly if its asset quality or earnings were to
deteriorate significantly. Economic conditions and the loss of confidence in financial institutions may increase the
Company's cost of funding and limit access to certain customary sources of capital, including inter-bank borrowings,
repurchase agreements and borrowings from the Federal Reserve Bank's discount window. The Company's ability to
raise additional capital, if needed, will depend on, among other things, conditions in the capital markets at that time,
which are outside of the Company's control, and the Company's financial performance.

The Company cannot assure that such capital will be available on acceptable terms or at all. Any occurrence that may
limit the Company's access to the capital markets, such as a decline in the confidence of debt purchasers, depositors of
the Bank or counterparties participating in the capital markets, or a downgrade of the parent company or the Bank's
ratings, may adversely affect the Company's capital costs and its ability to raise capital and, in turn, its liquidity.
Moreover, if the Company needs to raise capital in the future, it may have to do so when many other financial
institutions are also seeking to raise capital and would have to compete with those institutions for investors. An
inability to raise additional capital on acceptable terms when needed could have a material adverse effect on the
Company's liquidity, business, financial condition and results of operations.

The Company and its subsidiaries are subject to operational risk, which could adversely affect business, financial
condition and results of operation. The Company and its subsidiaries, like all businesses, are subject to operational
risk, including the risk of loss resulting from human error, fraud or unauthorized transactions due to inadequate or
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failed internal processes and systems, and external events that are wholly or partially beyond the Company's control
(including, for example, sudden increases in customer transaction volume, electrical or telecommunications outages,
natural disasters, and cyber-attacks). Operational risk also encompasses compliance (legal) risk, which is the risk of
loss from violations of, or noncompliance with, laws, rules, regulations, prescribed practices or ethical standards. The
Company and its subsidiaries have established a system of internal controls to address these risks, but there are
inherent limitations to such risk management strategies as there may exist, or develop in the future, risks that are not
anticipated, identified or monitored. Any losses resulting from operational risk could take the form of explicit charges,
increased operational costs, litigation costs, harm to reputation or forgone opportunities, loss of customer business, or
the unauthorized release, misuse, loss or destruction of proprietary information, any and all of which could have a
material adverse effect on the Company's business, financial condition and results of operations.
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The Company's directors and executive officers own a significant portion of the Company's common stock and can
exert significant influence over its business and corporate affairs. The Company's directors and executive officers, as a
group, beneficially owned 20.31% of the Company's common stock as of June 30, 2018. Consequently, if they vote
their shares in concert, they can significantly influence the outcome of matters submitted to the Company's
stockholders for approval, including the election of directors. The interests of the Company's directors and executive
officers may conflict with the interests of other holders of the Company's common stock, and the Company's directors
and executive officers may take actions affecting the Company with which other holders of the Company's common
stock disagree.

Future sales of the Company's common stock by stockholders or the perception that those sales could occur may cause
the common stock price to decline. Although the Company's common stock is listed for trading on the NASDAQ
stock market, the trading volume in the common stock may be lower than that of other larger financial institutions. A
public trading market having the desired characteristics of depth, liquidity and orderliness depends on the presence in
the marketplace of willing buyers and sellers of the common stock at any given time. This presence depends on the
individual decisions of investors and general economic and market conditions over which the Company has no
control. Given the potential for lower relative trading volume in the common stock, significant sales of the common
stock in the public market, or the perception that those sales may occur, could cause the trading price of the
Company's common stock to decline or to be lower than it otherwise might be in the absence of these sales or
perceptions.

Future issuances of the Company's common stock could adversely affect the market price of the common stock and
could be dilutive. The Company may issue additional shares of common stock or securities that are convertible into or
exchangeable for, or that represent the right to receive, shares of the Company's common stock. Issuances of a
substantial number of shares of common stock, or the expectation that such issuances might occur, could materially
adversely affect the market price of the common stock and could be dilutive to stockholders. Any decision the
Company makes to issue common stock in the future will depend on market conditions and other factors, and the
Company cannot predict or estimate the amount, timing, or nature of possible future issuances of common stock.
Accordingly, holders of the Company's common stock bear the risk that future issuances of securities will reduce the
market price of the common stock and dilute their stock holdings in the Company.

Item 1B. Unresolved Staff Comments

None.

Item 2. Properties

As of December 31, 2018, the Company owned and leased buildings in the normal course of business. It owns its
main office, which represents its corporate headquarters and includes a branch at 101 East Queen Street, Hampton,
Virginia. As of March 12, 2019, the Bank operated nineteen branches in the Hampton Roads area of Virginia.

For more information concerning the amounts recorded for premises and equipment and commitments under current
leasing agreements, see Note 7 of the Notes to Consolidated Financial Statements included in Item 8, “Financial
Statements and Supplementary Data” of this report on Form 10-K.

Item 3. Legal Proceedings

Neither the Company nor any of its subsidiaries is a party to any material pending legal proceedings before any court,
administrative agency, or other tribunal.

Item 4. Mine Safety Disclosures
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None.
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EXECUTIVE OFFICERS OF THE REGISTRANT

Name (Age) And Present
Position

Served in
Current
Position
Since

Principal Occupation During Past Five Years

Robert F. Shuford, Sr.
(81)
Chairman, President &
Chief Executive Officer
Old Point Financial
Corporation

1965 Chairman of the Board, President & Chief Executive Officer of the Company

Robert F. Shuford, Jr.
(54)

Executive Vice
President/Bank
Old Point Financial
Corporation

2015

Executive Vice President/Bank of the Company since 2015; Chief Operating
Officer & Senior Vice President/Operations of the Company from 2003 to 2015

President & Chief Executive Officer of the Bank since 2015; Senior Executive
Vice President & Chief Operating Officer of the Bank from 2012 to 2015;
Executive Vice President & Chief Operating Officer of the Bank from 2003 to
2012; Chairman of the Board of the Bank

Jeffrey W. Farrar (58)

Chief Financial Officer
& Senior Vice
President/Finance
Old Point Financial
Corporation

2017

Chief Financial Officer & Senior Vice President/Finance of the Company; a
Certified Public Accountant, Executive Vice President and Director of Wealth
Management, Mortgage and Insurance for Union Bankshares Corporation from
2014 to 2017; and  Chief Financial Officer for StellarOne Corporation and its
predecessor companies from 1996 to 2013.

Chief Financial Officer & Executive Vice President of the Bank

Eugene M. Jordan, II
(64)
Secretary to the Board &
Executive Vice
President/Trust
Old Point Financial
Corporation

2003

Secretary to the Board & Executive Vice President/Trust of the Company since
2015; Executive Vice President/ Trust of the Company from 2003 to 2015

President and Chief Executive Officer of Trust since 2003; Chairman of the
Trust Board

Joseph R. Witt (58)
Chief Business
Development Officer &
Senior Vice President
Old Point Financial
Corporation

2008 Chief Business Development Officer & Senior Vice President of the Company
since 2015; Chief Administrative Officer & Senior Vice
President/Administration of the Company from 2012 to 2015; Senior Vice
President/ Corporate Banking/Human Resources of the Company from 2010 to
2012; Senior Vice President/Corporate Banking of  the Company from 2008 to
2010

Senior Executive Vice President & Chief Business Development Officer of the
Bank since 2015; Senior Executive Vice President & Chief Administrative
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Officer of the Bank from 2012 to 2015; Executive Vice President/ Corporate
Banking & Human Resources Director of the Bank from 2010 to 2012

Part II

Item 5. Market for Registrant’s Common Equity, Related Stockholder Matters and Issuer Purchases of Equity
Securities

The common stock of the Company is quoted on the NASDAQ Capital Market under the symbol "OPOF". The
approximate number of stockholders of record as of March 12, 2019 was 1,635. On that date, the closing price of the
Company’s common stock on the NASDAQ Capital Market was $22.24. Additional information related to restrictions
on funds available for dividend declaration can be found in Note 17 of the Notes to Consolidated Financial Statements
included in Item 8, “Financial Statements and Supplementary Data” of this report on Form 10-K.

On January 12, 2010, the Company authorized a program to repurchase during any given calendar year up to an
aggregate of 5 percent of the shares of the Company’s common stock outstanding as of January 1 of that calendar year.
The Company did not repurchase any shares of the Company’s common stock under this plan during 2018. There is
currently no stated expiration date for this program.
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Pursuant to the Company’s stock option plans, participants may exercise stock options by surrendering shares of the
Company’s common stock that the participants already own. Shares surrendered by participants of these plans are
repurchased at current market value pursuant to the terms of the applicable stock options. No such repurchases
occurred during 2018.

Item 6. Selected Financial Data

The following table summarizes the Company's performance for the past five years.

SELECTED FINANCIAL HIGHLIGHTS

At and for the Years ended December 31, 2018 2017 2016 2015 2014
(dollars in thousands except per share data)
RESULTS OF OPERATIONS
Interest income $38,257 $32,934 $29,826 $30,295 $30,289
Interest expense 4,969 3,012 2,574 3,632 3,849
Net interest income 33,288 29,922 27,252 26,663 26,440
Provision for loan losses 2,861 4,160 1,930 1,025 600
Net interest income after provision for loan losses 30,427 25,762 25,322 25,638 25,840
Noninterest income 13,271 13,307 12,746 12,382 11,862
Noninterest expenses 38,500 39,195 34,111 34,332 33,390
Income before income taxes 5,198 (126 ) 3,957 3,688 4,312
Income tax expense 279 (97 ) 160 54 196
Net income (loss) $4,919 $(29 ) $3,797 $3,634 $4,116

FINANCIAL CONDITION
Total assets $1,038,183 $981,826 $902,966 $896,787 $876,280
Securities available for sale, at fair value 148,247 157,121 199,365 214,192 139,346
Loans held for investment, net of deferred fees and
costs 774,009 738,540 603,882 568,475 535,994
Allowance for loan losses 10,111 9,448 8,245 7,738 7,075
Deposits 843,144 783,594 784,502 746,471 716,654
Total borrowings 88,325 98,193 18,704 50,950 67,816
Total liabilities 936,177 885,438 808,976 803,611 787,783
Stockholders' equity 102,006 96,388 93,990 93,176 88,497

PERTINENT RATIOS
Return on average assets 0.48 % 0.00 % 0.43 % 0.41 % 0.47 %
Return on average equity 4.93 % (0.03 %) 3.99 % 4.02 % 4.81 %
Net interest margin (FTE) (1) 3.62 % 3.64 % 3.66 % 3.56 % 3.57 %
Efficiency ratio 82.69 % 90.67 % 85.28 % 87.93 % 87.18 %
Tier 1 capital to risk weighted assets 11.44 % 11.18 % 13.39 % 13.78 % 14.36 %
Total capital to risk weighted assets 12.59 % 12.28 % 14.51 % 14.89 % 15.44 %
Leverage ratio 9.77 % 9.98 % 10.68 % 10.93 % 10.75 %
Tangible common equity / tangible assets 9.65 % 9.76 % 10.41 % 10.39 % 10.10 %
Cash dividends declared $0.44 $0.44 $0.40 $0.34 $0.26
Book value $19.68 $19.20 $18.94 $18.79 $17.85

ASSET QUALITY
Nonaccrual loans $12,141 $12,882 $7,159 $4,582 $5,570
OREO $83 $- $1,067 $2,741 $5,106
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ALLL / total outstanding loans 1.31 % 1.28 % 1.37 % 1.36 % 1.32 %
Nonaccrual loans / total loans 1.57 % 1.74 % 1.19 % 0.81 % 1.04 %
ALLL / nonaccrual loans 83.28 % 73.34 % 115.17 % 168.88 % 127.02 %
NPAs / total outstanding loans 1.90 % 2.18 % 1.84 % 1.88 % 2.20 %
Net charge-offs / total average loans 0.29 % 0.44 % 0.24 % 0.06 % 0.07 %
Provision / total average loans 0.37 % 0.62 % 0.33 % 0.18 % 0.12 %
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